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Bid Tabulation

NANOPAC

Boundless AT

Please list proposed contract
price. (Listed price or discount
should include shipping, free
delivery, free installation and
lifetime support.)

Please list proposed contract price. (Listed price or discount should
include shipping, free delivery, free installation and lifetime support.)

Description

HIMS

BrailleSense 6 S 5,964.00 | No Bid
BrailleSense 6 mini S 4,759.00 | No Bid
1year PMA S 650.00 | No Bid
1 year PMA (After 30 days) S 700.00 | No Bid
2 years PMA S 1,250.00 | No Bid
2 years PMA (After 30 days) S 1,300.00 | No Bid
Dictionary / Thesaurus Free Download No Bid
AC Adapter S 60.00 | No Bid
TPU Case (BIk, Red, Blue) S 100.00 | No Bid
Battery S 120.00 | No Bid
Braille eMotion 40-cell Braille Display S 3,659.00 | No Bid
QBraille XL S 3,259.00 | No Bid
1year PMA S 470.00 | No Bid
1 year PMA (After 30 days) S 520.00 | No Bid
AC Adapter and Cable (USB Type C) S 55.00 | No Bid
SensePlayer OCR S 835.00 | No Bid
SensePlayer S 690.00 | No Bid
OCR Stand S 100.00 | No Bid
Leather Carrying Case S 113.00 | No Bid
AC Adapter and Cable (USB Type C) S 55.00 | No Bid
Taptilo v2.0+ S 1,413.00 | No Bid
HUMANWARE (Low Vision Products)

Upgrade Tablet Connect 12 V2.1 S 1,525.00 | No Bid
Connect 12 V2.1 S 3,640.00 | No Bid
Connect 12 V2.1 w/ distance camera SL10 S 3,840.00 | No Bid
Connect 12 V2.1 w/ distance camera SL25 S 3,940.00 | No Bid
Battery for SL10 or SL25 Camera S 94.00 | No Bid
Bluetooth Keyboard S 152.00 | No Bid
Camera Gooseneck & Plunger S 32.00 | No Bid
Carrying Case S 78.00 | No Bid
Carrying Case for Tablet S 38.00 | No Bid
Connect 12 Stand S 1,645.00 | No Bid
1 year purchased within 30 days of purchase S 365.00 | No Bid
1 year purchased after 30 days of purchase S 405.00 | No Bid
2 years purchased during the 1st year of warranty S 725.00 | No Bid
Reveal 16 S 3,400.00 | No Bid
Reveal 16with XY Table S 4,110.00 | No Bid
Reveal 16i S 4,400.00 | No Bid
Reveal 16i with XY Table S 5,110.00 | No Bid
Battery Pack S 464.00 | No Bid
Carrying Case $ 119.00 | No Bid
XY Table for the Reveal S 749.00 | No Bid
1 year purchased within 30 days of purchase $ 495.00 | No Bid
1 year purchased after 30 days of purchase S 550.00 | No Bid
2 years purchased during the 1st year of warranty $ 990.00 | No Bid
Desktop Power Supply S 129.00 | No Bid
Desktop Power Supply (includes power supply and powercord) $ 152.00 | No Bid
Prodigi Desktop Box and packaging S 65.00 | No Bid
Prodigi Desktop Power Cable (power cord only) $ 31.00 | No Bid
Explore 5 (includes 2 year warranty) S 880.00 | $ 802.75
Explore 8 (includes 2 year warranty) S 1,320.00 | $ 1,139.99
EXPLORE 12 (includes 2 year warranty) S 1,950.00 | No Bid
Explore 12 (No stand) (includes 2 year warranty) S 1,640.00 | No Bid
Explore 12 (Stand only) S 375.00 | No Bid
1-Year Extended Warranty Explore 5 S 60.00 | No Bid
2-Years Additional Extended Warranty Explore 5 S 105.00 | No Bid
1-Year Extended Warranty Explore 8 S 125.00 | No Bid
2-Years Extended Warranty Explore 8 S 225.00 | No Bid
1-Year Care Plan purchased within 30 days of purchase S 315.00 | No Bid
1-year Care Plan purchased after 30 days of purchase S 350.00 | No Bid
2-year Care Plan purchased anytime during initial coverage S 630.00 | No Bid
BrailleNote Touch 32 Plus S 5,870.00 | No Bid
BrailleNote Touch 18 Plus S 4,860.00 | No Bid
Battery for the BrailleNote Touch + S 89.00 | No Bid
BrailleNote Touch Carrying Case (this includes the braille keyboard) S 242.00 | No Bid
BrailleNote Touch Carrying Case with Shoulder Strap S 253.00 | No Bid
BrailleNote Touch + Care Program No Bid No Bid
One Year Care Program purchased within 30 days of purchase S 775.00 | No Bid
One Year Care Program purchased separately but during warranty period S 865.00 | No Bid
Brailliant BI 20X cells with input (includes 2 year warranty) S 2,244.00 | No Bid
Brailliant BI 40X cells with input (includes 2 year warranty) S 3,750.00 | No Bid
Brailliant BI40 Deluxe Carrying Case S 178.00 | No Bid
Brailliant Bl 40 Neoprene Carry Case S 55.00 | No Bid
Brailliant Bl 40X Battery Pack S 40.00 | No Bid




Brailliant Bl 20X Battery Pack S 48.00 | No Bid
Brailliant BI 20X Carrying Case $ 45.00 | No Bid
Brailliant Bl 20X Leather Carrying Case S 114.00 | No Bid
Brailliant BI 40X Carrying Case with Lanyard $ 87.00 | No Bid
One Year Care Program for New Brailliant Bl 20X S 435.00 | No Bid
One Year Care Program for New Brailliant Bl 40X S 545.00 | No Bid
Two Year Care Program for New Brailliant Bl 20X S 695.00 | No Bid
Two Year Care Program for New Brailliant Bl 40X S 895.00 | No Bid
MANTIS for US Customers S 2,695.00 | No Bid
Mantis TPU Silicone Case - Green S 18.00 | No Bid
Deluxe Leather Carrying Case for Mantis S 135.00 | No Bid
Battery for the Mantis S 40.00 | No Bid
Power supply for the Mantis S 30.00 | No Bid
Type A to Type C USB Cable 6ft. $ 27.00 | No Bid
Mantis Care Program No Bid No Bid
One Year Care Program S 595.00 | No Bid
Two Year Care Program S 895.00 | No Bid
MONARCH S 18,000.00 | No Bid
GPS (Global Positioning System) No bid No Bid
STELLAR TREK (includes 1 year warranty) S 1,615.00 | $ 1,515.25
Stellar Trek Accessories No Bid No Bid
Stellar Trek Executive Case S 100.00 | $ 61.70
VR TREK Accessories No bid No Bid
Carrying Case & wrist lanyard S 39.00 | No Bid
DELUXE Carrying Case for TREK S 83.00 | No Bid
Portable Back-up Battery S 43.00 | No Bid
Replacement Battery S 55.00 | No Bid
USB Cable for power supply S 32.00 | No Bid
USB Power Supply (Stream 2 and VR Trek) (no cable included Extended Warranty) $ 33.00 | No Bid
VR Trek Extended Warranty 1 Year S 95.00 | No Bid
VR Trek Extended Warranty 2 Years S 170.00 | No Bid
Stellar Trek Extended Warranty 1 Year S 179.00 | No Bid
Stellar Trek Extended Warranty 2 Years S 279.00 | No Bid
Stellar Trek Extended Warranty 1 Year with 1 accidental S 329.00 | No Bid
Stellar Trek Extended Warranty 2 Years with 1 accidental S 429.00 | No Bid
MOUNTBATTEN BRAILLER TUTOR (includes 2 year warranty S 5,610.00 | No Bid
Back-up Battery for Mountbatten S 73.00 | No Bid
Main Battery for MB Whisperer (must come into Service) S 264.00 | No Bid
Mimic Visual Display S 516.00 | No Bid
Mountbatten Carrying Case $ 147.00 | No Bid
Power Adaptor for Whisperer product line S 325.00 | No Bid
QWERTY Keyboard $ 62.00 | No Bid
Mountbatten Tutor Accessories No bid No Bid
Power supply (no cable included) (goes with 08- $ 107.00 | No Bid
MMB319012) No Bid No Bid
Power cable IEC USA (goes with 08-MMB006024) $ 28.00 | No Bid
Cable USB A/B (to connect the Tutor to a computer) S 13.00 | No Bid
Cable USB A/C (to charge the external keyboard) $ 17.00 | No Bid
One Year Extended Warranty for the Mountbatten Braille S 545.00 | No Bid
Tutor No Bid No Bid
PIAF Pictures in a Flash Tactile Graphic Maker (includes 1 S 1,785.00 | No Bid
year warranty) No Bid No Bid
Accessories No Bid No Bid
Two PIAF Marking Pens (one wide and thin) S 43.00 | No Bid
Tangible Magic Capsule paper 8 %” x 11” (100 sheets/package) S 170.00 | No Bid
Tangible Magic Capsule paper 11” x 11 %” (100 sheets/package) S 230.00 | No Bid
Tangible Magic Capsule paper 11” 17” (100 sheets/package) S 285.00 | No Bid
Extended Warranty No Bid No Bid
One Year Extended Warranty for the P.I.A.F S 225.00 | No Bid
Two Years Extended Warranty for the P.I.A.F S 395.00 | No Bid
ODYSSEY DESKTOP READER S 1,995.00 | No Bid
SINGLE-SIDED BRAILLE EMBOSSERS (includes 2 year warranty) No Bid No Bid
Romeo 60 S 3,810.00 | No Bid
Phoenix (single sided and Braille graphics embosser) S 3,120.00 | No Bid
Braille Labeler (1 year warranty) S 1,380.00 | No Bid
DOUBLE-SIDED BRAILLE EMBOSSERS (includes 2 year warranty) No bid No Bid
Basic D V5 (Index) S 4,320.00 | No Bid
Juliet 120 S 4,830.00 | No Bid
Everest V5 (Double sided cut sheet embosser) (Index) S 4,840.00 | No Bid
PRODUCTION BRAILLE EMBOSSERS (INDEX) (includes 2 year warranty) No Bid No Bid
FanFold-D V5 S 19,040.00 | No Bid
BrailleBox V5 S 16,844.00 | No Bid
Accessories No Bid No Bid
Acoustic Hood (fits Everest, Basic D, Juliet 120 & Romeo 60) S 1,635.00 | No Bid
Transend Software (electronic) (we need the customer's Duxbury License) S 545.00 | No Bid
Victor Reader Stratus (includes 1 year warranty) No Bid No Bid
Victor Reader Stratus 12M with WIFI S 525.00 | $ 470.25
Accessories No Bid No Bid
Portable Back-up Battery S 48.00 | No bid
Stratus Power Adaptor S 36.00 | $ 26.00
Stratus Battery Pack S 66.00 | $ 51.00
Stratus Plastic Key Cover S 33.00 | $ 23.00




One Year Victor Reader Stratus S 55.00 | No Bid

Two Years Victor Reader Stratus S 105.00 | No Bid

VICTOR READER STREAM (includes 1 year warranty) No Bid S 522.30
Victor Reader Stream 3.0 (28 units/case) (English) $ 595.00 | No Bid

Victor Reader Stream 3.0 (Spanish) S 595.00 | No Bid

Extended Warranty (Stream 2.0 & 3.0) No Bid No Bid

Victor Reader Stream (1 year) S 50.00 | No Bid

Victor Reader Stream (2 years) $ 90.00 | No Bid

IRIE-DOLPHIN

Magnifier Software No bid S 517.75
SuperNova Magnifier Software (includes 1 yr SMA) S 545.00 | $ 607.75
SuperNova Magnfier with Portable USB (includes 1 yr SMA) $ 645.00 | $ 702.75
Additional License SW S 385.00 | No bid

Additional License on USB S 485.00 | $ 702.75
Software Maintenance Agreement (SMA)-per license, per S 90.00 | $ 90.00
SMA for home users = 2 upgrades $ 130.00 | SMA is $90/year and is not based on the number of upgrades
Upgrade - price per version S 100.00 | No bid

IRIE-DOLPHIN

Magnifier & Screen Reader Software No bid S 1,581.75
SuperNova Magnifier & ScreenReader (includes 1 yr SMA) $ 1,665.00 | $ 1,871.75
SuperNova Magnfier & ScreenReader with Portable USB (Inclu S 1,765.00 | $ 1,966.75
Additional License SW S 1,205.00 | No bid

Additional License on USB S 1,305.00 | $ 1,966.75
Software Maintenance Agreement (SMA)-per license, per S 290.00 | $ 290.00
SMA for home users = 2 upgrades S 390.00 | SMA is $290/year and is not based on the number of upgrades
Upgrade - price per version S 300.00 | No bid

IRIE- AT

Clover Video Magnifiers No bid No Bid

CloverBook Pro XL (includes distance view and OCR) S 3,760.00 | No Bid

CloverView XL External Screen (only compatible w/ProXL) S 520.00 | No Bid

CloverBook 1-year Extended Warranty S 395.00 | No Bid

CloverBook Charger S 104.00 | No Bid

CloverBook Battery (all models) S 264.00 | No Bid

CloverBook Battery Docking Station w/power adaptor S 135.00 | No Bid

CloverBook Pro by Sightcare (includes distance view and O S 3,040.00 | No Bid

CloverView External Screen (only compatible w/Pro) S 374.00 | No Bid

CloverBook 1-year Extended Warranty S 299.00 | No Bid

CloverBook Charger S 74.00 | No Bid

CloverBook Battery S 264.00 | No Bid

CloverBook Battery Docking Station w/power adaptor $ 135.00 | No Bid

CloverBook Plus by Sightcare (includes distance view) S 2,340.00 | No Bid

CloverBook 1-year Extended Warranty $ 299.00 | No Bid

CloverBook Charger S 74.00 | No Bid

CloverBook Battery S 264.00 | No Bid

CloverBook Battery Docking Station w/power adaptor S 135.00 | No Bid

CloverBook Lite by Sightcare S 1,940.00 | No Bid

CloverBook Charger S 74.00 | No Bid

CloverBook Battery S 264.00 | No Bid

CloverBook Battery Docking Station w/power adaptor S 135.00 | No Bid

CloverNote HD by Sightcare S 1,584.00 | No Bid

CloverNote Camera Arm S 214.00 | No Bid

CloverNote HD Charger S 74.00 | No Bid

Clover 10 HD by Sightcare S 1,329.00 | No Bid

Clover 10 HD Charger S 54.00 | No Bid

Clover 10 HD Battery S 94.00 | No Bid

Clover 10 Assist Stand S 145.00 | No Bid

Clover 7S by Sightcare S 829.00 | No Bid

Clover 7S Charger S 54.00 | No Bid

Clover 7S Battery S 78.00 | No Bid

Clover 7 Assist Stand S 145.00 | No Bid

Clover 6 HD by Sightcare S 820.00 | No Bid

Clover 6 HD Charger S 54.00 | No Bid

Clover 6 HD Battery S 74.00 | No Bid

Clover 5 by Sightcare S 444.00 | No Bid

Clover 5 Charger S 44.00 | No Bid

Clover 5 Battery S 64.00 | No Bid

Clover 5 Handle S 49.00 | No Bid

Clover 4 by Sightcare S 274.00 | No Bid

Clover 4 Charger S 44.00 | No Bid

Clover 4 Battery S 64.00 | No Bid

Clover 4 Handle S 49.00 | No Bid

Clover 3 by Sightcare S 224.00 | No Bid

Clover 3 Charger S 44.00 | No Bid

Clover 3 Battery S 64.00 | No Bid

Distance Camera No bid No Bid

Magnibot by TrySight $ 3,030.00 | No Bid

Magnibot Stand S 324.00 | No Bid

Rehan Desktop Magnifiers No bid No Bid

Acuity 22" HD Speech by Rehan (Wireless Remote Inlcude S 3,815.00 | No Bid

Acuity Speech Remote $ 165.00 | No Bid

Acuity Power Supply S 44.00 | No Bid

Acuity 22" HD by Rehan (Wireless Remote Included) $ 2,815.00 | No Bid




Acuity Basic Remote (Advanced) S 165.00 | No Bid
Acuity Power Supply $ 44.00 | No Bid
i-See 22" HD by Rehan S 2,215.00 | No Bid
Power Supply $ 44.00 | No Bid
Rehan Video Magnifiers No bid No Bid
Looky Book Pro by Rehan (includes distance view andOCR $ 3,340.00 | No Bid
Looky Book External Screen S 374.00 | No Bid
Looky Book Charger $ 74.00 | No Bid
Looky Book Battery S 264.00 | No Bid
Looky Book Battery Docking Station $ 74.00 | No Bid
Looky 10 HD by Rehan S 1,329.00 | No Bid
Looky 10 Charger $ 54.00 | No Bid
Looky 10 Battery S 94.00 | No Bid
Looky 10 Assist Stand S 145.00 | No Bid
Looky 7 HD by Rehan S 829.00 | No Bid
Looky 7 Charger S 54.00 | No Bid
Looky 7 Battery S 78.00 | No Bid
Looky 7 Assist Stand S 145.00 | No Bid
Looky 6 HD by Sightcare S 820.00 | No Bid
Looky 6 Charger S 54.00 | No Bid
Looky 6 Battery S 74.00 | No Bid
Looky 5 HD by Rehan S 724.00 | No Bid
Looky 5 Charger S 39.00 | No Bid
Looky 5 Battery S 74.00 | No Bid
Looky 5 Charging Station S 139.00 | No Bid
Looky 4+ HD by Rehan S 624.00 | No Bid
Looky 4+ Charger S 39.00 | No Bid
Looky 4+ Battery S 39.00 | No Bid
Reading Machines No bid No Bid
i-Reader 2 by Rehan (Battery Included) S 2,034.00 | No Bid
i-Reader 2 Power Supply S 49.00 | No Bid
ReadEasy Evolve MAX by VisionAid S 2,530.00 | No Bid
ReadEasy Evolve Feature Pack S 415.00 | No Bid
ReadEasy Evolve ECO by VisionAid (battery included) S 1,930.00 | No Bid
Readit Zen by VisionAid (8.5x11 documents) S 1,830.00 | No Bid
VisionAid Keypad S 170.00 | No Bid
Readit Zen MAX by VisionAid (11x17 documents) S 2,030.00 | No Bid
VisionAid Keypad S 170.00 | No Bid
Readit Air by VisionAid S 1,530.00 | No Bid
VisionAid Keypad $ 170.00 | No Bid
Readit Scholar HD by VisionAid S 3,030.00 | No Bid
IRIE Braille Embossers No bid No Bid
IRIE Braille Buddy (Tiger Software Suite Included) S 1,540.00 | No Bid
IRIE Braille Buddy - 1 yr ex warranty $ 199.00 | No Bid
IRIE Braille Buddy - 2 yr ex warranty S 369.00 | No Bid
IRIE Braille Buddy - 3 yr ex warranty $ 529.00 | No Bid
IRIE Braille Buddy- 4 yr ex warranty S 669.00 | No Bid
IRIE BrailleTrac 120 (GoBraille Included) S 3,665.00 | No Bid
IRIE BrailleTrac 120 - 1 yr ex warranty S 359.00 | No Bid
IRIE BrailleTrac 120 - 2 yr ex warranty $ 685.00 | No Bid
IRIE BrailleTrac 120 - 3 yr ex warranty S 970.00 | No Bid
IRIE BrailleTrac 120 - 4 yr ex warranty S 1,225.00 | No Bid
IRIE BrailleSheet 120 (GoBraille Included) S 4,365.00 | No Bid
IRIE BrailleSheet 120 - 1 yr ex warranty S 429.00 | No Bid
IRIE BrailleSheet 120 - 2 yr ex warranty S 815.00 | No Bid
IRIE BrailleSheet 120 - 3 yr ex warranty S 1,160.00 | No Bid
IRIE BrailleSheet 120 - 4 yr ex warranty S 1,460.00 | No Bid
ViewPlus Braille Embossers No bid No Bid
VP Embraille (Tiger Softwasre Suite Included) S 2,045.00 | No Bid
VP Embraille - 1 yr ex warranty S 199.00 | No Bid
VP Embraille - 2 yr ex warranty S 379.00 | No Bid
VP Embraille - 3 yr ex warranty S 539.00 | No Bid
VP Embraille- 4 yr ex warranty S 679.00 | No Bid
VP Columbia 2 (Tiger Software Suite Included) S 3,565.00 | No Bid
VP Columbia 2 - 1 yr ex warranty S 349.00 | No Bid
VP Columbia 2 - 2 yr ex warranty S 659.00 | No Bid
VP Columbia 2 - 3 yr ex warranty S 939.00 | No Bid
VP Columbia 2 - 4 yr ex warranty S 1,189.00 | No Bid
VP Delta 2 (Tiger Software Suite Included) S 4,265.00 | No Bid
VP Delta 2 - 1 yr ex warranty S 419.00 | No Bid
VP Delta 2 - 2 yr ex warranty S 799.00 | No Bid
VP Delta 2 - 3 yr ex warranty S 1,129.00 | No Bid
VP Delta 2 - 4 yr ex warranty S 1,429.00 | No Bid
VP Rogue Tractor-Fed (Tiger Software Suite Included) S 6,065.00 | No Bid
VP Rogue Trac - 1 yr ex warranty S 599.00 | No Bid
VP Rogue Trac - 2 yr ex warranty $ 1,139.00 | No Bid
VP Rogue Trac - 3 yr ex warranty S 1,619.00 | No Bid
VP Rogue Trac - 4 yr ex warranty $ 2,039.00 | No Bid
VP Rogue Cut-Sheet Feed (Tiger Software Suite Included) S 6,565.00 | No Bid
VP Rogue Sheet - 1 yr ex warranty $ 659.00 | No Bid
VP Rogue Sheet - 2 yr ex warranty S 1,249.00 | No Bid
VP Rogue Sheet - 3 yr ex warranty $ 1,779.00 | No Bid




VP Rogue Sheet - 4 yr ex warranty S 2,239.00 | No Bid
VP SpotDot (Tiger Software Suite Included) $ 8,065.00 | No Bid
VP SpotDot - 1 yr ex warranty S 799.00 | No Bid
VP SpotDot - 2 yr ex warranty $ 1,519.00 | No Bid
VP SpotDot - 3 yr ex warranty S 2,159.00 | No Bid
VP SpotDot - 4 yr ex warranty $ 2,719.00 | No Bid
VP Premier (Tiger Software Suite Included) S 10,115.00 | No Bid
VP Premier - 1 yr ex warranty $ 999.00 | No Bid
VP Premier - 2 yr ex warranty S 1,899.00 | No Bid
VP Premier - 3 yr ex warranty S 2,699.00 | No Bid
VP Premier - 4 yr ex warranty S 3,399.00 | No Bid
VP Elite (Tiger Software Suite Included) $ 15,115.00 | No Bid
VP Elite - 1 yr ex warranty S 1,499.00 | No Bid
VP Elite - 2 yr ex warranty S 2,849.00 | No Bid
VP Elite - 3 yr ex warranty S 4,049.00 | No Bid
VP Elite - 4 yr ex warranty S 5,099.00 | No Bid
VP InkConnect - ink attachment for VP Premier or Elite S 4,065.00 | No Bid
VP InkConnect - 1 yr ex warranty S 399.00 | No Bid
VP InkConnect - 2 yr ex warranty S 759.00 | No Bid
VP InkConnect - 3 yr ex warranty S 1,079.00 | No Bid
VP InkConnect - 4 yr ex warranty S 1,359.00 | No Bid
Embosser Accessories No bid No Bid
Travel Case- Brailly Buddy or Embraille S 259.00 | No Bid
GoBraille - wireless printing with IRIE Embossers S 315.00 | No Bid
Tiger Box - wireless printing with ViewPlus embossers S 315.00 | No Bid
VP InkConnect - ink (black) S 90.00 | No Bid
VP SpotDot Ink- Black S 64.00 | No Bid
VP SpotDot Ink- Color S 99.00 | No Bid
Braille Translation Software No bid No Bid
Tiger Software Suite - Annual Subscription S 195.00 | No Bid
Tiger Software Suite - Perpetual License S 595.00 | No Bid
Tiger Software Suite - Upgrade S 395.00 | No Bid
Tactile Graphics No bid No Bid
TactileView No bid No Bid
Tactile Graphics Design Suite (PKG) S 1,334.00 | No Bid
TactileView Design Software S 595.00 | No Bid
TactileView Design Software Upgrade S 395.00 | No Bid
TactiPad Drawing Tablet S 534.00 | No Bid
TactiPad Paper (25 sheets) S 30.00 | No Bid
Tactile Graphics Embosser Package - Select Embosser No bid No Bid
Tactile Graphics Package for STEM - Select Embosser No bid No Bid
TactileView Motorized Drawing Arm (MDA) $ 2,995.00 | No Bid
Braille Displays No bid No Bid
b.note 20 by Eurobraille S 2,735.00 | No Bid
esysuite software S 795.00 | No Bid
b.note 40 by Eurobraille S 3,605.00 | No Bid
esysuite software S 795.00 | No Bid
Qbraille XL by HIMS (40-cell) S 3,250.00 | No Bid
PMA/yr - two additional years available S 470.00 | No Bid
AC Adaptor S 50.00 | No Bid
Braille Notetakers No bid No Bid
b.book by Eurobraille S 5,805.00 | No Bid
VISPERO -Al Squared

ZoomText Magnifier S 630.00 | No Bid
SMA, ZoomText Magnifier S 160.00 | No Bid
SMA Renewal, ZoomText Magnifier S 160.00 | No Bid
ZoomText Magnifier Upgrade - Single Version S 160.00 | No Bid
ZoomText Magnifier Upgrade - Two Versions $ 320.00 | No Bid
ZoomText Magnifier Upgrade - 3 or More Versions S 480.00 | No Bid
ZoomText Magnifier Non-Enterprise - Sold in 5-seat increments (Price per Seat) $ 405.00 | No Bid
SMA, ZoomText Magnifier Non-Enterprise License (Price per Seat) S 115.00 | No Bid
ZoomText Magnifier Non-Enterprise License Upgrade - Single Version (Price per Seat) S 115.00 | No Bid
ZoomText Magnifier Non-Enterprise License Upgrade - Two Versions (Price per Seat) S 200.00 | No Bid
ZoomText Magnifier Non-Enterprise License Upgrade - 3 or More Versions (Price per Seat) S 275.00 | No Bid
ZoomText Magnifier Enterprise - Sold in 5-seat increments (Price per Seat) $ 575.00 | No Bid
SMA, ZoomText Magnifier Enterprise License (Price per Seat) S 145.00 | No Bid
ZoomText Magnifier Enterprise License Upgrade - Single $ 145.00 | No Bid
Version (Price per Seat) No bid No Bid
ZoomText Magnifier Enterprise License Upgrade - Two $ 290.00 | No Bid
Versions (Price per Seat) No bid No Bid
ZoomText Magnifier Enterprise License Upgrade - 3 or More $ 430.00 | No Bid
Versions (Price per Seat) No bid No Bid
ZoomText Magnifier/Reader S 880.00 | No Bid
SMA NEW OR RENEWAL, ZOOMTEXT S 220.00 | No Bid
MAGNIFIER/READER No bid No Bid
SMA Renewal, ZoomText Magnifier/Reader S 220.00 | No Bid
ZoomText Magnifier/Reader Upgrade - Single Version $ 220.00 | No Bid
ZoomText Magnifier/Reader Upgrade - Two Versions S 440.00 | No Bid
ZoomText Magnifier/Reader Upgrade - 3 or More Versions $ 660.00 | No Bid




ZoomText Magnifier/Reader Non-Enterprise - Sold in 5-seat S 565.00 | No Bid
increments (Price per Seat) No bid No Bid
SMA, ZoomText Magnifier/Reader Non-Enterprise License (Price per Seat) S 160.00 | No Bid
ZoomText Magnifier/Reader Non-Enterprise License Upgrade - Single Version (Price per Seat) | $ 160.00 | No Bid
ZoomText Magnifier/Reader Non-Enterprise License Upgrade - Two Versions (Price per Seat) | $ 280.00 | No Bid
ZoomText Magnifier/Reader Non-Enterprise License Upgrade - 3 or More Versions (Price per

Seat) S 390.00 | No Bid
ZoomText Magnifier/Reader Enterprise - Sold in 5-seat increments (Price per Seat) S 800.00 | No Bid
SMA, ZoomText Magnifier/Reader Enterprise License (Price per Seat) $ 200.00 | No Bid
ZoomText Magnifier/Reader Enterprise License Upgrade - Single Version (Price per Seat) $ 200.00 | No Bid
ZoomText Magnifier/Reader Enterprise License Upgrade -Two Versions (Price per Seat) $ 400.00 | No Bid
ZoomText Magnifier/Reader Enterprise License Upgrade - 3 or More Versions (Price per Seat) | $ 600.00 | No Bid
Fusion Pro S 2,280.00 | No Bid
SMA, Fusion Pro S 570.00 | No Bid
SMA Renewal, Fusion Pro S 570.00 | No Bid
Fusion Pro Upgrade - Single Version $ 570.00 | No Bid
Fusion Pro Upgrade - Two Versions S 1,140.00 | No Bid
Fusion Pro Upgrade - 3 or More Versions S 1,710.00 | No Bid
Fusion Home S 1,690.00 | No Bid
SMA, Fusion Home S 340.00 | No Bid
SMA Renewal, Fusion Home S 340.00 | No Bid
Fusion Home Upgrade - Single Version $ 340.00 | No Bid
Fusion Home Upgrade - Two Versions S 680.00 | No Bid
Fusion Home Upgrade - 3 or More Versions S 1,020.00 | No Bid
Fusion Non-Enterprise - Sold in 5-seat increments (Price per Seat) S 1,300.00 | No Bid
SMA, Fusion Non-Enterprise License (Price per Seat) $ 350.00 | No Bid
Fusion Non-Enterprise License Upgrade - Single Version (Price per Seat) S 350.00 | No Bid
Fusion Non-Enterprise License Upgrade - Two Versions (Price Per Seat) $ 615.00 | No Bid
Fusion Non-Enterprise License Upgrade - 3 or More Versions (Price per Seat) S 860.00 | No Bid
Fusion Enterprise - Sold in 5-seat increments (Price per Seat) $ 2,080.00 | No Bid
SMA, Fusion Enterprise License (Price per Seat) S 495.00 | No Bid
Fusion Enterprise License Upgrade - Single Version (Price per Seat) $ 495.00 | No Bid
Fusion Enterprise License Upgrade - Two Versions (Price per Seat) S 990.00 | No Bid
Fusion Enterprise License Upgrade - 3 or More Versions(Price per Seat) $ 1,485.00 | No Bid
Freedom Dongle USB (Dongle can be used for JAWS, ZoomText, Fusion, and/or OpenBook) S 100.00 | No Bid
Keyboard, ZoomText Large-Print - U.S. English - White Print on Black S 197.00 | No Bid
Keyboard, ZoomText Large-Print - U.S. English - Black Print on Yellow $ 197.00 | No Bid
ZoomText Keyboard Light Bar - Black S 59.00 | No Bid
ZoomText Keyboard Light Bar - Silver $ 59.00 | No Bid
VISPERO - FREEDOM

Focus 14 Blue (V) S 1,590.00 | No Bid
Focus 40 Blue (V) S 3,615.00 | No Bid
Focus 80 Blue (V) S 9,585.00 | No Bid
Focus 14 Blue Carrying Case S 51.45 | No Bid
Focus 14 Blue (IV) Leather Carrying Case $ 130.00 | No Bid
Focus 14 Blue (V) Leather Carrying Case S 130.00 | No Bid
Focus 40 Blue (IV) Leather Carrying Case $ 165.00 | No Bid
Focus 40 Blue (V) Leather Carrying Case S 165.00 | No Bid
JAWS®/Fusion/ZoomText Timed License (90 Day) S 290.00 | No Bid
JAWS® Home S 1,200.00 | No Bid
JAWS® Home SMA $ 190.00 | No Bid
JAWS® Home SMA Renewal S 190.00 | No Bid
JAWS® Home Upgrade - Single Version $ 190.00 | No Bid
JAWS® Home Upgrade - Two Versions S 380.00 | No Bid
JAWS® Home Upgrade - 3 or More Versions $ 570.00 | No Bid
JAWS® Pro S 1,625.00 | No Bid
JAWS® Pro SMA $ 400.00 | No Bid
JAWS® Pro SMA Renewal S 400.00 | No Bid
JAWS® Pro Upgrade - Single Version $ 400.00 | No Bid
JAWS® Pro Upgrade - Two Versions S 800.00 | No Bid
JAWS® Pro Upgrade - 3 or More Versions S 1,200.00 | No Bid
JAWS® Non-Enterprise - Sold in 5-seat increments (Price per Seat) S 925.00 | No Bid
SMA, JAWS® Non-Enterprise (Price per Seat) $ 265.00 | No Bid
JAWS® Non-Enterprise License Upgrade - Single Version (Price per Seat) S 265.00 | No Bid
JAWS® Non-Enterprise License Upgrade - Two Versions (Price per Seat) $ 460.00 | No Bid
JAWS® Non-Enterprise License Upgrade - 3 or More Versions (Price per Seat) S 645.00 | No Bid
JAWS® Enterprise - Sold in 5-seat increments (Price per Seat) $ 1,475.00 | No Bid
SMA, JAWS® Enterprise (Price per Seat) S 370.00 | No Bid
JAWS® Enterprise License Upgrade - Single Version (Price per Seat) $ 370.00 | No Bid
JAWS® Enterprise License Upgrade - Two Versions (Price per Seat) S 740.00 | No Bid
JAWS® Enterprise License Upgrade - 3 or More Versions (Price per Seat) $ 1,110.00 | No Bid
JAWS® Remote Access & Tandem Direct S 220.00 | No Bid
Freedom Dongle USB (Dongle can be used for JAWS, $ 100.00 | No Bid
ZoomText, Fusion, and/or OpenBook) No bid No Bid
PEARL® Camera S 350.50 | No Bid




PEARL® Carrying Case S 34.90 | No Bid
PEARL® PMA $ 94.50 | No Bid
OpenBook® S 1,000.00 | No Bid
OpenBook® English Upgrade - Single Version $ 150.00 | No Bid
OpenBook® English Upgrade - 2 or More Versions S 150.00 | No Bid
OpenBook Non-Enterprise - Sold in 5-seat increments (Price per Seat) $ 700.00 | No Bid
OpenBook Non-Enterprise License Upgrade - Single Version S 300.00 | No Bid
OpenBook Non-Enterprise License Upgrade - 2 or More Versions $ 600.00 | No Bid
OpenBook Enterprise - Sold in 5-seat increments (Price per Seat) S 800.00 | No Bid
OpenBook Enterprise License Upgrade - Single Version $ 350.00 | No Bid
OpenBook Enterprise License Upgrade - 2 or More Versions S 700.00 | No Bid
TOPAZ® XL HD Camera Only S 2,975.00 | No Bid
TOPAZ® XL HD 22" S 3,880.00 | No Bid
TOPAZ® XL HD 24" $ 4,180.00 | No Bid
TOPAZ® EZ HD 24" S 3,216.75 | No Bid
TOPAZ OCR 24 $ 4,885.00 | No Bid
TOPAZ Ultra 15" S 3,625.00 | No Bid
TOPAZ Ultra 17" $ 3,908.50 | No Bid
TOPAZ Ultra Rolling Case for 15" or 17" S 150.00 | No Bid
GEM™ (use with TOPAZ XL via USB) $ 309.75 | No Bid
TOPAZ XL HD OCR PACKAGE (Includes GEM 5.0 & OpenBook) S 519.75 | No Bid
ONYX® Deskset HD 22 $ 3,140.00 | No Bid
ONYX® Deskset HD 22 (w/o Case) S 3,025.00 | No Bid
ONYX® Deskset HD 24 $ 3,375.00 | No Bid
ONYX® Deskset HD 24 (w/o Case) S 3,260.00 | No Bid
ONYX® OCR 24 $ 4,695.00 | No Bid
ONYX® Pro S 3,795.00 | No Bid
ONYX® Deskset XY Table S 310.00 | No Bid
ONYX® Portable HD Mini XY Table S 215.00 | No Bid
ONYX® Mini X-Y Table $ 201.00 | No Bid
Rolling Case ONYX® Deskset 22" (Fits HD Model) S 190.40 | No Bid
Rolling Case ONYX® Deskset 24" (Fits HD Model) $ 213.50 | No Bid
Rolling Case ONYX® OCR S 213.50 | No Bid
RUBY® $ 625.60 | No Bid
RUBY® HD S 735.85 | No Bid
RUBY® XL HD $ 1,012.00 | No Bid
RUBY® 10 with Speech S 2,015.00 | No Bid
RUBY® 10 without Speech S 1,675.00 | No Bid
RUBY® 10 Carry Case S 72.00 | No Bid
RUBY® and RUBY® HD Carrying Case $ 38.95 | No Bid
RUBY XL HD Case S 38.95 | No Bid
Merlin elite Pro Full Page HD/OCR 24" S 4,775.00 | $ 4,408.00
Merlin Ultra 24" Flat Panel Monitor S 4,160.00 | $ 3,842.75
Merlin Ultra 22" Flat Panel Monitor S 3,855.00 | S 3,562.50
Merlin Color basic 720p HD Base - w/o monitor (MRDE-A) S 2,285.00 | S 2,090.00
Merlin Classic 720p, w/DVI, English, Type Aplug S 2,465.00 | $ 2,261.00
Merlin HD/Ultra Ultra Pack (add lines, windowing & computer toggle) $ 165.00 | 142.50
Merlin Footswitch Ultra Kit (computer toggle) S 65.00 | $ 47.50
Merlin Plexi screen (keep materials flat) $ 27.00 | S 16.15
Merlin - Additional 2 year warranty S 350.00 | S 332.50
Merlin elite Pro HD/OCR - Additional 2 year warranty S 450.00 | $ 427.50
Merlin Full HD-mini 15" S 3,615.00 | $ 3,391.50
Merlin Full HD-mini 17" S 3,908.50 | $ 3,660.82
Merlin Full HD-mini Rolling Case (fits 15" or 17") S 140.00 | $ 109.25
Acrobat HD Ultra LCD 27" S 3,795.00 | $ 3,505.50
Acrobat HD Ultra LCD 24" & Rolling Case S 3,540.00 | $ 3,272.75
Acrobat HD Ultra LCD 24" S 3,415.00 | $ 3,163.50
Acrobat HD Ultra LCD 22" & Rolling Case S 3,305.00 | $ 3,049.50
Acrobat HD Ultra LCD 22" S 3,180.00 | $ 2,940.25
Acrobat HD - mini Ultra & Rolling Case S 3,155.00 | $ 2,935.50
Acrobat HD - mini Ultra S 3,080.00 | $ 2,864.25
Acrobat HD Ultra large X-Y Table S 297.50 | $ 249.37
Acrobat HD - mini Ultra X-Y Table S 182.50 | $ 149.62
Acrobat HD Ultra - HDMI Toggle Box and Switch S 90.00 | $ 71.25
Acrobat Line - Additional 2 year warranty S 350.00 | $ 332.50
Transformer HD/Wi-Fi/OCR S 3,610.00 | $ 3,386.75
Transformer HD/OCR No Wi-FI S 3,445.00 | S 3,230.00
Transformer HD/Wi-Fi S 3,140.00 | S 2,940.25
Transformer - Suction Base S 135.00 | $ 118.75
Transformer - Extra Battery S 70.00 | $ 57.00
Transformer - Extra Battery Charger S 60.00 | $ 47.50
Transformer - Extra Soft Shell Carrying Case (Holds Complete Unit) S 65.00 | S 47.50
Transformer HD - 8hr. Battery Pack S 162.00 | $ 142.50
Transformer HD - Additional 2 year warranty S 250.00 | $ 237.50
Transformer HD/OCR - Additional 2 year warranty S 300.00 | $ 285.00
DaVinci Pro OCR 24" Flat Panel Monitor S 4,895.00 | $ 4,522.00
DaVinci Pro - OCR Guide Frame S 35.00 | $ 19.00
DaVinci - Large X-Y Table S 297.50 | $ 249.37
DaVinci - Mini X-Y Table S 187.50 | $ 149.62
DaVinci - Anti-vibration Pad S 14.00 | $ 9.50
DaVinci Pro Case S 218.00 | $ 190.00




DaVinci Pro - Additional 2 year warranty S 395.00 | $ 375.25
Smart Reader HD with Console S 2,540.00 | S 2,370.25
Smart Reader HD S 2,305.00 | S 2,147.00
Smart Reader HD - Additional 2 year warranty S 250.00 | $ 190.00
Amigo 8 HD S 1,435.00 | S 1,330.00
Amigo HD (color buttons) S 1,134.00 | N/A - discontinued

Amigo HD (black/white buttons) S 1,134.00 | N/A - discontinued

Amigo HD - Additional 2 year warranty $ 225.00 | N/A - discontinued

Pebble HD 4.3 B/W (color buttons) S 681.00 | $ 623.20
Pebble HD 4.3 B/W (black/white buttons) S 681.00 | $ 623.20
Pebble HD 4.3 Red (color buttons) S 681.00 | $ 623.20
Pebble HD 4.3 Blue (color buttons) S 681.00 | $ 623.20
Pebble HD 4.3 - Additional 2 year warranty S 150.00 | $ 142.50
VISPERO - OPTELEC

POWERMAG+ 2.5X/6D "HALOBRIGHT" WHITE LED HAND S 107.14 | No bid

POWERMAG+ 3X/8D "HALOBRIGHT" WHITE LED HAND $ 107.14 | No bid

POWERMAG+ 3.5X/10D "HALOBRIGHT" WHITE LED HAND S 98.68 | No bid

POWERMAG+ 4X/12D "HALOBRIGHT" WHITE LED HAND $ 92.36 | No bid

POWERMAG+ 5X/16D "HALOBRIGHT" WHITE LED HAND S 92.36 | No bid

POWERMAG+ 6X/20D "HALOBRIGHT" WHITE LED HAND $ 92.36 | No bid

POWERMAG+ 7X/24D "HALOBRIGHT" WHITE LED HAND S 92.36 | No bid

POWERMAG+ 8X/28D "HALOBRIGHT" WHITE LED HAND $ 92.36 | No bid

POWERMAG+ 10.75X/39D "HALOBRIGHT" WHITE LED HAN S 88.14 | No bid

POWERMAG+ 13X/48D "HALOBRIGHT" WHITE LED HAND $ 88.14 | No bid

POWERMAG+ 15X/56D "HALOBRIGHT" WHITE LED HAND S 88.14 | No bid

BOX: POWERMAG+ "HALOBRIGHT" STAND KIT 4 MAGS (3 $ 421.74 | No bid

POWERMAG+ 3X/8D "HALOBRIGHT" WHITE LED S 130.36 | No bid

POWERMAG+ 4X/12D "HALOBRIGHT" WHITE LED $ 96.58 | No bid

POWERMAG+ 5X/16D "HALOBRIGHT" WHITE LED S 96.58 | No bid

POWERMAG+ 6X/20D "HALOBRIGHT" WHITE LED $ 96.58 | No bid

POWERMAG+ 7X/24D "HALOBRIGHT" WHITE LED S 96.58 | No bid

POWERMAG+ 8X/28D "HALOBRIGHT" WHITE LED $ 96.58 | No bid

POWERMAG+ 10.75X/39D "HALOBRIGHT" WHITE LED S 100.80 | No bid

POWERMAG+ 13/48D "HALOBRIGHT" WHITE LED $ 100.80 | No bid

POWERMAG+ 15X/56D "HALOBRIGHT" WHITE LED S 100.80 | No bid

BOX: POWERMAG+ "HALOBRIGHT" STAND KIT 4 MAGS (3 $ 442.86 | No bid

POWERMAG+ HALO WHT HANDLE S 71.24 | No bid

POWERMAG+ 2.5X/6D "BRIGHT WHITE" LED HAND $ 100.80 | No bid

POWERMAG+ 3X/8D "BRIGHT WHITE" LED HAND S 100.80 | No bid

POWERMAG+ 3.5X/10D ANGLED "BRIGHT WHITE" LED HA $ 92.36 | No bid

POWERMAG+ 3.5X/10D "BRIGHT WHITE" LED HAND S 92.36 | No bid

POWERMAG+ 4X/12D "BRIGHT WHITE" LED HAND $ 81.80 | No bid

POWERMAG+ 5X/16D "BRIGHT WHITE" LED HAND S 81.80 | No bid

POWERMAG+ 6X/20D "BRIGHT WHITE" LED HAND $ 81.80 | No bid

POWERMAG+ 7X/24D "BRIGHT WHITE" LED HAND S 81.80 | No bid

POWERMAG+ 8X/28D "BRIGHT WHITE" LED HAND $ 81.80 | No bid

POWERMAG+ 10.75X/39D "BRIGHT WHITE" LED HAND S 75.46 | No bid

POWERMAG+ 13X/48D "BRIGHT WHITE" LED HAND $ 75.46 | No bid

POWERMAG+ 15X/56D "BRIGHT WHITE" LED HAND S 75.46 | No bid

POWERMAG+ 3X/8D "BRIGHT WHITE" LED STAND $ 128.24 | No bid

POWERMAG+ 4X/12D "BRIGHT WHITE" LED STAND S 92.36 | No bid

POWERMAG+ 5X/16D "BRIGHT WHITE" LED STAND $ 92.36 | No bid

POWERMAG+ 6X/20D "BRIGHT WHITE" LED STAND S 92.36 | No bid

POWERMAG+ 7X/24D "BRIGHT WHITE" LED STAND $ 92.36 | No bid

POWERMAG+ 8X/28D "BRIGHT WHITE" LED STAND S 92.36 | No bid

POWERMAG+ 10.75X/39D "BRIGHT WHITE" LED STAND $ 96.58 | No bid

POWERMAG+ 3X/8D LED STAND HEAD ONLY S 77.58 | No bid

POWERMAG+ 13X/48D "BRIGHT WHITE" LED STAND $ 96.58 | No bid

POWERMAG+ 4X/12D LED STAND HEAD ONLY S 52.24 | No bid

POWERMAG+ 5X/16D LED STAND HEAD ONLY $ 52.24 | No bid

POWERMAG+ 15X/56D "BRIGHT WHITE" LED STAND S 96.58 | No bid

POWERMAG+ 6X/20D LED STAND HEAD ONLY $ 52.24 | No bid

POWERMAG+ 7X/24D LED STAND HEAD ONLY S 52.24 | No bid

POWERMAG+ 8X/28D LED STAND HEAD ONLY $ 52.24 | No bid

POWERMAG+ 10.75X/39D LED STAND HEAD ONLY S 71.24 | No bid

POWERMAG+ 13X/48D LED STAND HEAD ONLY $ 75.46 | No bid

POWERMAG+ 15X/56D LED STAND HEAD ONLY S 75.46 | No bid

BOX: POWERMAG+ HANDHELD KIT 8 PCS $ 578.00 | No bid

BOX: POWERMAG+ HALO BRIGHT HANDHELD KIT 7 MAG S 662.46 | No bid

BOX: POWERMAG+ HALOBRIGHT HANDHELD KIT 6 MAGS $ 628.68 | No bid

POWERMAG+ BRIGHT WHT HANDLE S 67.02 | No bid

ClearView C 22" HD ONE BT $ 3,670.00 | No bid

ClearView C 24" Full HD BT S 4,140.00 | No bid

ClearView C Full HD Speech S 4,875.00 | No bid

Comfort Top tray XY-Table, ClearView C S 98.00 | No bid

Compact Comfort Top tray XY-Table, ClearView C $ 98.00 | No bid

ClearView C Wireless Remote Control S 115.00 | No bid

ClearView C Bluetooth Remote Control S 115.00 | No bid

ClearView C Bluetooth Upgrade Kit S 163.82 | No bid

ClearView+ 22" HD Standard Arm S 3,595.00 | No bid

ClearView+ 22" HD UFA S 3,770.00 | No bid

ClearView+ 22" Full HD UFA $ 3,835.00 | No bid




ClearView+ 24" Full HD Speech S 4,725.00 | No bid

ClearView+ 24" Full HD UFA $ 4,130.00 | No bid

Base Unit XY Table Zero Button Ready S 583.00 | No bid

Feature Pack - Basic S 115.00 | No bid

Feature Pack - Advanced S 167.50 | No bid

ClearView G3 Speech Monitor, 13mp Camera, 24" S 3,020.00 | No bid

Compact 7 HD S 1,017.00 | No bid

Compact 10 HD No Speech for US S 1,580.00 | No bid

Compact 10 HD Speech for US S 1,935.00 | No bid

Compact HD Power Supply Wall Adapter $ 25.69 | No bid

Compact 7 HD Wall Adapter S 41.50 | No bid

ClearView GO 15" S 3,615.00 | No bid

ClearView GO 17" S 3,908.50 | No bid

Clearview GO Carry Case for 15" S 62.00 | No bid

ClearView GO Rolling Case for 15" or 17" S 140.00 | No bid

ClearView GO Charger US S 60.00 | No bid

Traveller HD S 2,540.00 | No bid

Traveller Reading Stand S 153.00 | No bid

Traveller Carry Case S 109.00 | No bid

ClearReader+ Basic (AC powered only) $ 2,185.00 | No bid

ClearReader+ (Battery & AC powered) S 2,420.00 | No bid

ClearReader+ Advanced (w/ Mag. FP) S 2,725.00 | No bid

ClearReader AC Adapter S 52.00 | No bid

Magnification Feature Pack S 272.50 | No bid

CR+ or Basic Case S 62.50 | No bid

LYRIQ

LyriQ Accessible Reader S 2,135.00 | S 2,085.25
LyriQ Keypad $ 250.00 | $ 223.25
DUXBURY

Duxbury for Windows S 695.00 | $ 660.25
Duxbury for Mac S 695.00 | $ 660.25
WEARABLES

OrCam Wearable Assistive Technology no bid no bid

MyEye 3 (w/cast) $ 4,525.00 | Discontinued

OrCam My Eye Pro S 4,285.00 | $ 4,265.50
Read 3 (w/cast) S 3,535.00 | S 2,650.50
OrCam READ S 2,025.00 | $ 1,890.50
OrCam My Eye 2 Reader $ 3,535.00 | MyEye 2 Pro is 4037.5

OrCam READ S 2,025.00 | $ 1,890.50
Vision Buddy no bid S 2,845.25
Vision Buddy TV (Headset V3 + TV Hub + Computer Link) S 3,040.00 | S 2,845.25
Vision Buddy CCTV (Headset V3 + CCTV mini + Computer Lin S 3,040.00 | S 3,795.25
Vision Buddy Pro (Headset V3 + TV Hub + CCTVmini + Comp S 4,050.00 | $ 2,845.25
IrisVision Live no bid Discontinued

IrisVision Live 2.0 S 3,344.00 | $ 3,134.05
E-sight 4 no bid No bid

E-sight glasses for the blind and visually imapired. S 7,025.00 | No bid

Envision Glasses no bid no bid

Envision Glasses Professional S 3,544.00 | S 3,499.00
Envision Glasses Home S 2,544.00 | S 2,499.00
Envision Glasses Read S 1,944.00 | $ 1,899.00
Envision Glasses Smith Optics S 424.00 | No bid

Envision Glasses Shaded Lenses S 169.00 | No bid

Envision Glasses Lux Tortoise S 169.00 | No bid

Envision Glasses Lux Glacier S 169.00 | No bid

Envision Glasses Titanium S 219.00 | No bid

LOW VISION INTERNATIONAL

Desktop Video Magnifier Table with lockable wheels. Dimensio $ 415.00 | No bid

5" Handheld Video Magnifier S 730.00 | No bid

7" Handheld Video Magnifier S 935.00 | No bid

MagniLink One, HD 720p, 17” integrated monitor and carrying S 2,550.00 | No bid

MagniLink One, HD 720p, 17” integrated monitor, integrated A S 2,960.00 | No bid

MagniLink PRO, FHD 1080p, including reading plate, control b S 4,580.00 | No bid

TTS Software WIN [Including US English + 1 extra language] $ 300.00 | No bid

TTS Software MAC S 300.00 | No bid

TTS Software ChromeViewer 4.0 or later S 300.00 | No bid

Remove able reading table with friction brakes X/Y, 14.2” x 13” S 375.00 | No bid

MagniLink S Full HD 1 080p including SW for WIN/MAC/Chro S 4,080.00 | No bid

TTS Software WIN [Including US English + 1 extra language] S 300.00 | No bid

TTS Software MAC S 300.00 | No bid

TTS Software ChromeViewer 4.0 or later S 300.00 | No bid

MagniLink S Docking Station 2, with XY-Table S 945.00 | No bid

MagniLink S Docking Station 2, with Plate S 795.00 | No bid

USB/HDMI Module (connection module only) $ 415.00 | No bid

USB/HDMI Module + power supply and cables S 486.00 | No bid

Portable XY-table for MagnilLink S (13,4” x 9,5”) S 335.00 | No bid

Large button external hand control for use with MLS (included USB 3.0 1m C — C cable $ 315.00 | No bid

MagniLink TAB Excluding Tablet Including stand to fit 13" Micr S 3,760.00 | No bid

MagniLink TAB Including stand, 13” Microsoft Surface Pro 8 T S 4,960.00 | No bid

MagniLink TAB Including stand, 13” Microsoft Surface Pro8 T S 5,960.00 | No bid

LVI adapter kit to allow you to fit a Surface Pro 8 into you existi $ 169.00 | No bid




Send in your MLTAB/MLTAB-P/MLTAB-US/MLTAB-P-US and S 624.00 | No bid
MagniLink Vision with Full HD 1080p Camera, integrated XY ta S 3,330.00 | No bid
MagniLink Vision with Full HD 1080p Camera, integrated XY ta S 4,395.00 | No bid
MaghniLink Voice 2 [Including monitor output (HDMI), battery, ¢ $ 2,530.00 | No bid
MagniLink ZIP Full HD 1 080p, 13” integrated monitor and carr S 3,310.00 | No bid
MagniLink ZIP Full HD 1 080p, 17” integrated monitor and carr S 3,460.00 | No bid
MagniLink ZIP integrated A3 reading table (16,7” x 16,5”) with f S 425.00 | No bid
MagniLink ZIP battery $ 315.00 | No bid
HDMI/USB connection board Including connection board, EUC S 315.00 | No bid
Software for WIN/MAC/Chromebook (need to add if ordering T S 180.00 | No bid
TTS Software WIN [Including US English + 1 extra language] S 300.00 | No bid
TTS Software MAC S 300.00 | No bid
TTS Software ChromeViewer 4.0 or later S 300.00 | No bid
Power Supply / AC Adapter for ML-ZIP, ML-One, ML-Voice2, S 64.00 | No bid
MagniLink Zip Battery S 315.00 | No bid
Remove able reading table with friction brakes X/Y, 14.2” x 13” S 365.00 | No bid
Wheeled case accepts ML One, ML PRO, or ML Zip (either siz S 224.00 | No bid
PCViewer Standalone. Software with OCR/TTS for use without S 450.00 | No bid
Upgrade to MagniLink PCViewer, latest version S 260.00 | No bid
Upgrade to MagniLink MACViewer, latest version $ 260.00 | No bid
Upgrade to MAgniLink ChromeViewer, latest version, incl. firm S 260.00 | No bid
1-year extended warranty (3 years in total), price per unit $ 270.00 | No bid
2-year extended warranty (4 years in total), price per unit S 599.00 | No bid
LVI Large print Bluetooth keyboard for Windows 7 thru 10. (White) $ 169.00 | No bid
LVI Large print Bluetooth keyboard for Windows 7 thru 10. (Black) S 169.00 | No bid

Discount lines

IRIE Catolog Discount 0.00% Certain items on this spreadsheet are subject to 5% discount
Vespero Catolog Discount 0.00% No bid

Hims Catolog Discount 0.00% No bid

Humanware Catolog Discount 0.00% 5% for select products

LyriQ Catolog Discount 0.00% No bid

Duxbury Catolog Discount 0.00% 5.00%

Wearables Catolog Discount 0.00% 5.00%

Low Vision Inteernational (LVI) Catolog Discount 0.00% No bid

Whole Vendor Catolog Discount 0.00% 5.00%
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